
 

 

HYBRID PARAMEDIC PROGRAM  
CHECK – OFF SHEET FOR OUT-OF-STATE AND INTERNATIONAL STUDENTS 

 

 Have you created your NREMT account? This is necessary for all INTERNATIONAL 
students so you can challenge the NREMT-Basic exam upon arrival in the U.S. 
Through the NREMT you schedule your COGNITIVE exam at 
https://www.nremt.org/rwd/public/dashboard/create-account . The SSN it requires 
will be issued to your instructor from the NREMT, who will then forward it to you. 
There is a fee associated with the creation of this account, and you must pay for it in 
full before your instructor can see your name on the verification list. Cost: $80.00.  
 

 Have you created your NIEMT account and scheduled your EMT-Basic Psychomotor 
exams? If you are an international student, you will need to challenge this portion of 
the test upon arrival in the U.S. You can sign up for the psychomotor exam on the 
date and time you prefer. To create your NIEMT account, go here: 
https://niemt.com/index.php/emt-testing . You MUST take your psychomotor exam 
PRIOR to taking the WRITTEN exam (this is a MO state regulation). Cost: $70.00. 
 

 Missouri state licensing: BEFORE you can become a licensed EMT in the state of 
MO., you must do two things: a) pass both the cognitive and psychomotor exams as 
outlined above, and 2) get a criminal background check (fingerprint cards). You 
should get your fingerprint cards from your instructor (you need TWO cards). Take 
these cards to the Newton County Sheriff’s Department in Neosho at 208 W. Coler St, 
Neosho, MO. There is a fee associated with getting fingerprinted and this is at your 
own expense.  
 

 Have you made housing arrangements during your stay in Neosho, MO? Crowder 
College offers both dorms and apartments, but you may also elect to stay off-
campus if you so choose. To fill out a housing application (dorms/apartments), go to  
http://www.crowder.edu/services/student-life/housing/ for more information. 
 

 Have you made transportation arrangements during your stay in Neosho, MO? 
There is no public transportation in and around the Neosho/Joplin area, so you 
should either make plans to rent a car, or buy a very inexpensive car when you 
arrive. International students have done both. For information on car rentals in the 
Neosho, MO area, go here: https://www.enterprise.com/en/car-
rental/locations/us/mo/griffith-motors-519x.html.   
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